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Questions for Dads to ask 

their older daughters



What do you like 
daydreaming about?

What’s a memory that 
makes you happy?

Let’s say you’re at the 
beach: What’s the first 
thing you do?

What makes you feel 
loved?

If you wrote a book, what 
would it be about?

If you designed clothes, 
what would they look like?

What makes you feel 
thankful?
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What makes your friends 
so awesome?

What makes you so 
awesome?

What are three things you 
want to do this summer?

If you joined the circus, 
what would your circus act 
be?

If you were a teacher and 
could teach your students 
anything at all, what would 
you teach them?

What is something that 
makes our family special?

8

9

10

11

12

13



If you had to pick a theme 
song to describe you, what 
would it be?

What is the best thing that 
ever happened to you?

If you found a genie in a 
bottle, what would be your 
three wishes?

What do you think is the 
most difficult job in the 
world? Why?

What do you think is the 
best job in the world? 
Why?

If you could time travel, 
when and where would 
you go?
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What would life be like if 
no one had a phone?

If you could be any age for 
the rest of your life, what 
age would you be? Why?

What is your favorite 
dessert?

If you could meet a 
famous person, who 
would it be?

What was the worst thing 
you have ever eaten? Why 
was it so bad?

If you could put 
ANYTHING on top of 
a pizza, what would you 
pick?
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